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.

20 September 2013 Hand Delivery

Mr. Dan Sykes, CEO

New Hanover County ABC Board
5235, 17" st.

Wilmington, NC 28401-5548

Re: Certified Tabulation of Bids
Recommendation of Award
ABC Headquarters Building
New Hanover County ABC Board
Wilmington, NC
LS3P No. 7103-131020-060
Dear Dan:
Enclosed is another original Certified Tabulation of the Bids that were received yesterday.

We are pleased with the bids a recommend award to the low bidder as follows:

Bordeaux Construction Co., Inc.

Durham, NC

Base Bid: $3,906,000.
Alternate No71 Engine Generator and Associated Work S 65,000.
Alternat€ No. 2 Polished Concrete in LBD Sales 101 S 15,800.

Taotal recommended Single Prime General Contract $3,986,300.

“Elliott O’Neal, Jr.
irector Bidding & Contract Services
Associate Principal
LS3P
Celebrating 50 Years of Architecture, Interior Architecture and Planning
Attachment
cc: Mr. Charles H. Boney, Jr., FAIA, LEED AP
Ms. Taylor Simms, AlA, LEED AP
7103-131020-060-Bid Tab-Recaward-09202013
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ENGAGE DESIGN TRANSFORM

BID TABULATION

SINGLE PRIME

Project:

ABC Headquarters Facility

Market Street, Wilmington, NC
Project #: 7103-131020
Bid Date: Thursday,Sept 19, 2013- 3:00 pm
Bid Location: New Hanover County
Government Complex, 230 Government
Center Dr., Room 500, Wilmington NC

. U | etz
General Contractors mccnwnﬁﬂsa License # mow“u& MBE| E-Verify MMM_M_“M” Base Bid oﬁﬁﬁ A_“.w_.mws in (Base Bid +
Assoclated alos Alternates)
Work) 101
BORDEAUX CONSTRUCTION CO., INC. 9266 Y Y Y Y $3,906,000.00 | $65,000.00 | $15,800.00 $3,986,800.00
Plumbin ANDERSON
Mechanical HARRILSON
Electrical AB BLAKE
GROUP Il MANAGMENT, INC. 22369 Y Y Y. Y $4,657,000.00 | $65,000.00 | $55,000.00 $4,777,000.00
Plumbing ANDERSON
Mechanical HARRILSON
Electrical BLAKE
J. M. THOMPSON CO. 474 Y Y ¥ ¥ $4,258,000.00 | $64,000.00 | $1,985.00 $4,323,985.00
Plumbin ANDERSON
Mechanical HARRILSON
Electrical AB BLAKE
MONTEITH CONSTRUCTION CORP. 43319 Y Y N Y $4,098,000.00 | $63,000.00 | $30,000.00 $4,191,000.00
Plumbing M&M
Mechanical HARRILSON
Electrical AB BLAKE
THOMAS CONSTRUCTION GROUP NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Plumbing
Mechanical
Electrical
WIMCOQ CORP. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Plumbing
Mechanical
Electrical
W. M. JORDAN CO. 29260 Y ad ¥ Y $4,462,000.00 | $49,800.00 | $5,500.00 $4,517,300.00
Plumbing ANDERSON
Mechanical HARRILSON
Electrical AB BLAKE

These bid numbers have been checked against the mo% d, frorp ﬁ no::mﬂ. bidding the job and have been found to be accurate.

W. m_._ozozmm_ Jr., Associate Pr o_um_

LS3P ASSOCIATES LTD.
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